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Manager's Introduction

Welcome to the latest edition of our newsletter! The beginning of 2025 has been
lively and bustling as we participate in the exciting events that accompany this time
of year. Join us as we share some highlights from the past few months...

Also, if you know someone who would like to receive our email newsletters/updates
please just let us know, or forward them the newsletter sign up link below:

Newsletter Sign-Up 

Best wishes,

Simon Paul
Home Manager

News & Updates

Here at The Hazelwell, we’re dedicated to enhancing the lives of our residents, and
we’re always looking for ways to improve our services. Following the wonderful
feedback received during our December relatives’ meeting, we’ve expanded our
dedicated activities team to offer even more opportunities for residents to enjoy
fulfilling, personalised experiences.

We have a new team member called Robyn who has joined our experienced
Activities Co-ordinator, Kath, to bring fresh energy and creativity to our already
packed wellbeing programme. This expansion means we can now dedicate twice the
amount of time to a wide range of activities, ensuring even more choices for our
residents. 

Robyn has truly hit the ground running. She is a talented singer and has already
delighted residents with impromptu afternoon performances, spreading joy and
adding a personal touch to our community. Sharing her thoughts on joining the team,
Robyn said:

"It is such a pleasure to join the activities team at The Hazelwell and to get to know
all of the lovely residents who live here. They have all been very welcoming, and I
feel like part of the community already."

Fun-Filled Activities 7 Days A Week

Our activities programme now runs seven days a week, offering an even wider
variety of options for residents to enjoy. One of the newest additions, the Saturday
“ChatterDay” club, has quickly become a firm favourite. Each week, residents
choose a topic to explore, and the following Saturday, they come together to share
their findings. In December, the group dived into the origins of Christmas traditions,
learning the fascinating history behind carols and the custom of exchanging
Christmas cards.

Festive Overview

Our residents experienced a delightful festive treat with a mesmerising Christmas
pantomime that came to life right here in our care home. Joy filled the air as our
talented actors presented a lively show that brought a smile to everyone’s face. The
vibrant costumes, engaging storyline, and the sheer enthusiasm of the performers
truly captured the spirit of Christmas. 

No Christmas celebration at The Hazelwell would be complete without the cheerful
notes of music and the rhythm of dance. This year, we were graced by a marvellous
entertainer who filled our home with joyous melodies and lively tunes, inspiring many
of our residents to join in on the fun.

Sta! Wellbeing Sessions

Wellbeing is a measure of health, satisfaction and happiness. When it comes to
workplace wellbeing, this refers to the state of employees’ mental and physical
health resulting from dynamics within the workplace. This includes their relationships
with colleagues, their workload, work environment and many other factors. Investing
in the mental and physical health of employees will not only improve their quality of
life, but will help to create a more engaged, motivated, and high-performing
workforce. Thank you to Oceansage Therapies for providing out Staff Wellbeing
Sessions...

Social Media

Make sure to check out our Facebook Page and please give us a "Like" to keep up
with all our news.

https://www.facebook.com/hazelwellcare

Leave A Review

We would be very grateful if you could spare a few minutes to write a review for us:

Carehome.co.uk Reviews

Google Reviews
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